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    EPN 361 - ANNEX A 

PCSPS Scheme Medical Adviser 
 
New Contract Prices 

                        

      
 

 WEF 1 July 2013 
 

 WEF – To Be Announced   

  

  Service Name 
 

Unit Price - 
Paper 
Submission 

 
Unit Price - Online 
(paperless) Submission 

  

  
      

  

  1 Medical Retirement   £104   £79   

  1a 
Review of Upper Tier 
Award   £143   £118   

  2 

Appeal against decision 
that medical retirement 
criteria are not met:           

  2a First Stage Appeal   £137   £118   

  2b Second Stage Appeal   £338   £313   

  2c 

Appeal to Medical 
Review Board 
Independent of 
Contractor - 
Arrangement Fee   £143   £118   

    Board Chair   £644   £644   

    Board Member   £542   £542   

  3 

Early Payment of 
Preserved Pension 
Benefits on Medical 
Grounds   £104   £79   

  4 Pension Allocation   £143   £118   

             

  4a 
Medical Examination 
Reveals Health Doubt   £258   £233   

  4b 

Examination by 
consultant inconclusive 
or where member 
produces contrary 
report by a consultant.    £181   £156   
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5 

 
Advice on Civil Service 
Injury Benefit Scheme 
(CSIBS) applications.   

  5a 
Advising on Qualifying 
Injury   £143   £118   

  5b 

Assessment of 
impairment of earnings 
capacity.   £181   £156   

  6 

Ad hoc issues raised by 
employers/pensions 
administrator relating to 
schemes’ provisions - 
Hourly Rate   £218   £193   

    Half Day Rate   £630   £605   

    Daily Rate   £1,191   £1,166   

  7 

Medical retirement and 
other data as required 
by employers/pensions 
administrator (Per 
Hour)   £224   £199   

  8 

Inadequate referral - 
case referred without 
sufficient information to 
allow Contractor to 
carry out requested 
service.   £69   £43   

  9 

PCSPS Medical 
Examination (standard 
single consultation).   £258   £233   

  10 

PCSPS Medical 
Examination (extended 
session for a complex 
case consultation).   £335   £310   

  11 

Obtaining further 
medical evidence or 
third party reports (does 
not include medical 
appeals, where such 
reports must be 
provided by the 
appellant).   £143   £118   

  12 Medical Opinion.   £143   £118   

  13 
Re-referral – Medical 
retirement.   £143   £118   
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  14 Re-referral – CSIBS.   £143   £118   

  15 

Non-attendance at pre-
arranged face to face 
consultation.   100% of fee   100% of fee   

  16 

Cancellation/reschedule 
of appointment - 
Cancellation / 
reschedule of 
appointment less than 
48 hours’ notice    100% of fee   100% of fee   

  17 
Domiciliary / home 
visits     £585 hourly   £559 hourly   

        £1,018 half day   £993 half day   

        £1,610 daily   £1,585 daily   

  18 Training Courses   £191 individual    £191 individual   

        £2,484 bespoke   £2,484 bespoke   

  19 

Appeal against decision 
to withdraw upper tier 
benefits following a 
periodic review - Upper 
Tier Review Appeal   £218   £193   

  20 

Review of advice on 
Civil Service Injury 
Benefit Scheme 
(CSIBS) applications 
and appeal against 
levels of impairment 
and apportionment 
awarded           

  20a Injury benefit review   £218   £193   

  20b 
Injury benefit appeal –
     stage 1   £218   £193   

  20c 
Injury benefit appeal –    
stage 2   £293   £268   

  21 
HMRC severe ill health 
assessments           

  21a 

Where the assessment 
takes place at the same 
time as the IHR 
assessment   £95   £70   

  21b 
Where the assessment 
takes place after the   £94   £68   
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IHR assessment – 
nuvos and 
premium/classic plus 
shemes 

  21c 

Where the assessment 
takes place after the 
IHR assessment – 
classic scheme   £94   £68   

  21d 

Where the Contractor 
needs additional 
evidence solely in 
relation to the HMRC 
assessment   £258   £233   

 


